
Industrial-process measurement, control and automation

No Category MS/ISO Code MS/ISO  Title Preview

1 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation IEC 60381-1

Analogue signals for process control 
systems. Part 1: Direct

current signals

2 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation IEC 60381-2

Analogue signals for process control 
systems. Part 2: Direct

voltage signals

3 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation IEC 60382 Analogue pneumatic signal for process 

control systems

4 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation IEC 60946

Binary direct voltage signals for process 
measurement and control

systems

5 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation IEC 61506

Industrial-process measurement and 
control - Documentation of

application software

6 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation IEC 62419

Control technology - Rules for the 
designation of measuring

instrument

7 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation IEC 62424

Representation of process control 
engineering - Requests in P&I

diagrams and data exchange between 
P&ID tools and PCE-CAE

tools

8 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation

IEC TS 62443-
1-1

Industrial communication networks - 
Network and system security - Part 1-1: 

Terminology, concepts and models

9 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation IEC 62443-2-1

Industrial communication networks - 
Network and system security - Part 2-1: 

Establishing an industrial automation and 
control system security program

Industrial-process measurement, control and automation

24/5/2022 1



Industrial-process measurement, control and automation

No Category MS/ISO Code MS/ISO  Title Preview

Industrial-process measurement, control and automation

10 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation

IEC TR 62443-
2-3

Security for industrial automation and 
control systems - Part 2-3:

Patch management in the IACS 
environment

11 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation IEC 62443-2-4

Security for industrial automation and 
control systems - Part 2-4:

Security program requirements for IACS 
service providers

12 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation

IEC TR 62443-
3-1

Industrial communication networks - 
Network and system security - Part 3-1: 

Security technologies for industrial 
automation and control systems

13 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation IEC 62443-3-2

Security for industrial automation and 
control systems - Part 3-2:

Security risk assessment for system 
design

14 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation IEC 62443-3-3

Industrial communication networks - 
Network and system security - Part 3-3: 

System security requirements and 
security levels

15 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation IEC 62443-3-3

Corrigendum 1 - Industrial 
communication networks - Network and 

system security - Part 3-3: System 
security requirements and

security levels

16 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation IEC 62443-4-1

Security for industrial automation and 
control systems - Part 4-1:

Secure product development lifecycle 
requirements
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17 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation IEC 62443-4-2

Security for industrial automation and 
control systems - Part 4-2:

Technical security requirements for IACS 
components

18 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation IEC 62832-1

Industrial-process measurement, control 
and automation - Digital

factory framework - Part 1: General 
principles

19 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation IEC 62832-2

Industrial-process measurement, control 
and automation - Digital

factory framework - Part 2: Model 
elements

20 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation IEC 62832-3

Industrial-process measurement, control 
and automation - Digital

factory framework - Part 3: Application of 
Digital Factory for life

cycle management of production systems

21 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation IEC TR 62837 Energy efficiency through automation 

systems

22 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation

IEC TS 62872-
1

Industrial-process measurement, control 
and automation - Part 1:

System interface between industrial 
facilities and the smart grid

23 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation IEC 62890

Industrial-process measurement, control 
and automation - Lifecycle-management 

for systems and components
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24 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation IEC TR 63069

Industrial-process measurement, control 
and automation -

Framework for functional safety and 
security

25 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation

IEC PAS 
63088

Smart manufacturing - Reference 
architecture model industry 4.0

(RAMI4.0)

26 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation

IEC PAS 
63131 System control diagram

27 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation

IEC TS 63164-
1 

Reliability of industrial automation 
devices and systems - Part 1:

Assurance of automation devices 
reliability data and specification

of their source

28 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation

IEC TR 63164-
2

Reliability of industrial automation 
devices and systems - Part 2: System 

reliability

29 Industrial-process measurement, 
control and automation

IEC PAS 
63325

Lifecycle requirements for functional 
safety and security for IACS
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